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She had no name, no family, and no memory of her past.

Raised by strangers on an isolated mountain since she was a young child, Weewona doesn’t know her real
name or even her birthday. She’s never seen a horse or ridden in a carriage; but on one momentous day, she
ventures down the mountain to where a tent revival meeting is being held.

For the first time, Weewona hears the beautiful lyrics of a hymn that promise peace and glory with God.
She’s not certain what those lyrics mean, but she yearns to hear them again. Weewona is determined to
discover the purpose behind the hymn’s promises, even if it means she must leave her solitary mountain life
and live in the strange and sometimes frightening civilized world.

This unabridged edition of the 1911 classic Christian novel includes a biography of the author, group
discussion questions, and additional bonus content.
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From reader reviews:

Carol Ratliff:

Do you have favorite book? In case you have, what is your favorite's book? Guide is very important thing for
us to understand everything in the world. Each reserve has different aim as well as goal; it means that book
has different type. Some people feel enjoy to spend their the perfect time to read a book. They can be reading
whatever they get because their hobby is definitely reading a book. Think about the person who don't like
examining a book? Sometime, man feel need book if they found difficult problem or perhaps exercise. Well,
probably you will require this Lost on the Trail.

Bruce Williamson:

Nowadays reading books be a little more than want or need but also be a life style. This reading routine give
you lot of advantages. Advantages you got of course the knowledge the actual information inside the book
that will improve your knowledge and information. The knowledge you get based on what kind of
publication you read, if you want attract knowledge just go with schooling books but if you want experience
happy read one having theme for entertaining like comic or novel. Typically the Lost on the Trail is kind of
reserve which is giving the reader unforeseen experience.

Martin Hobson:

In this time globalization it is important to someone to get information. The information will make a
professional understand the condition of the world. The fitness of the world makes the information much
easier to share. You can find a lot of referrals to get information example: internet, paper, book, and soon.
You can view that now, a lot of publisher which print many kinds of book. Typically the book that
recommended to you personally is Lost on the Trail this publication consist a lot of the information of the
condition of this world now. This book was represented so why is the world has grown up. The language
styles that writer make usage of to explain it is easy to understand. Often the writer made some research
when he makes this book. That's why this book ideal all of you.

Nancy Gump:

What is your hobby? Have you heard which question when you got pupils? We believe that that issue was
given by teacher for their students. Many kinds of hobby, Every individual has different hobby. And also you
know that little person including reading or as looking at become their hobby. You have to know that reading
is very important and book as to be the thing. Book is important thing to incorporate you knowledge, except
your personal teacher or lecturer. You find good news or update concerning something by book. Numerous
books that can you take to be your object. One of them is Lost on the Trail.
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