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Awarded 5 Stars by popular book site, Readers' Favorite, this is New Zealand teen author K T Bowes' first in
the Troubled series.

Sophia Armitage has a secret that will make everyone see her differently. She's a decent girl from a good
family. They have worked hard to end up on ‘the right side of the tracks’ in the central north island town of
Hamilton in New Zealand.

But things are never quite what they seem and for the troubled teen, life at the failing high school in the north
of the city starts to horribly unravel. Finally pushed too far by a group of girls whose only purpose in life is
to make her existence a misery, Sophia is forced to fight back, ending in disastrous consequences.

Sophia's painful crush on Dane McArdle, the alpha male of the poisonous little group from the wrong side of
town, unleashes a whole host of trouble onto Sophia’s head.

Their families are so different and yet who gets to decide which side of the tracks is the right side and once
you’ve landed on the wrong side, what will be the cost of crossing back over?
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From reader reviews:

Kimberly Rubio:

Exactly why? Because this Free from the Tracks (Troubled Book 1) is an unordinary book that the inside of
the guide waiting for you to snap it but latter it will jolt you with the secret it inside. Reading this book close
to it was fantastic author who also write the book in such remarkable way makes the content within easier to
understand, entertaining technique but still convey the meaning totally. So , it is good for you because of not
hesitating having this nowadays or you going to regret it. This phenomenal book will give you a lot of
benefits than the other book get such as help improving your skill and your critical thinking approach. So ,
still want to postpone having that book? If I had been you I will go to the e-book store hurriedly.

Michael Hamrick:

Many people spending their time period by playing outside with friends, fun activity using family or just
watching TV the entire day. You can have new activity to shell out your whole day by studying a book. Ugh,
think reading a book can actually hard because you have to accept the book everywhere? It okay you can
have the e-book, delivering everywhere you want in your Mobile phone. Like Free from the Tracks
(Troubled Book 1) which is obtaining the e-book version. So , why not try out this book? Let's find.

Paul Kennedy:

Don't be worry if you are afraid that this book may filled the space in your house, you might have it in e-
book approach, more simple and reachable. That Free from the Tracks (Troubled Book 1) can give you a lot
of close friends because by you checking out this one book you have point that they don't and make you
actually more like an interesting person. That book can be one of one step for you to get success. This book
offer you information that maybe your friend doesn't recognize, by knowing more than other make you to be
great men and women. So , why hesitate? We should have Free from the Tracks (Troubled Book 1).

Jesus Rhode:

You will get this Free from the Tracks (Troubled Book 1) by browse the bookstore or Mall. Just simply
viewing or reviewing it could possibly to be your solve challenge if you get difficulties for the knowledge.
Kinds of this guide are various. Not only by means of written or printed but additionally can you enjoy this
book by e-book. In the modern era similar to now, you just looking from your mobile phone and searching
what their problem. Right now, choose your current ways to get more information about your publication. It
is most important to arrange yourself to make your knowledge are still up-date. Let's try to choose suitable
ways for you.
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