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Things tend to become more complicated for those of us who want to comprehend gravity. Observations and
recent calculations from astronomers, suggest gravity on its own can't sustain how galaxies function.
Scientists have concurred that a significant amount of mass should exist in order to produce the necessary
gravity to justify behaviors like rotational speed of masses, without resulting in stars being expelled out of
galaxies into space. As gravity is presupposed to be produced by a mass, when researchers couldn't find it in
their observations, they have deduced that something called “Dark Matter” exists. That is a mass that can't be
seen, that doesn't interact in any way with humankind, but that does produce gravity.
In this book, original and innovative ideas are put forward. Those comprise an answer to what existed even
before the Big Bang, how could the expansion of the Universe work without the intervention of Dark
Energy, and how the denominated Dark Matter could simply be gravity without the presence of any mass.
All this being possible thanks to gravity turning out to be just the manifestation of the Expansion of the
Universe.
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From reader reviews:

James Marcotte:

Why don't make it to be your habit? Right now, try to ready your time to do the important behave, like
looking for your favorite guide and reading a reserve. Beside you can solve your trouble; you can add your
knowledge by the e-book entitled What if Gravity is not a force?. Try to make book What if Gravity is not a
force? as your good friend. It means that it can being your friend when you sense alone and beside that
course make you smarter than previously. Yeah, it is very fortuned for you personally. The book makes you
considerably more confidence because you can know everything by the book. So , let me make new
experience as well as knowledge with this book.

Sarah Jackson:

Information is provisions for those to get better life, information today can get by anyone on everywhere.
The information can be a knowledge or any news even restricted. What people must be consider any time
those information which is from the former life are hard to be find than now is taking seriously which one
would work to believe or which one often the resource are convinced. If you receive the unstable resource
then you get it as your main information you will see huge disadvantage for you. All of those possibilities
will not happen throughout you if you take What if Gravity is not a force? as your daily resource
information.

Julian Eaton:

The e-book with title What if Gravity is not a force? contains a lot of information that you can find out it.
You can get a lot of advantage after read this book. This specific book exist new understanding the
information that exist in this book represented the condition of the world today. That is important to yo7u to
be aware of how the improvement of the world. This kind of book will bring you throughout new era of the
internationalization. You can read the e-book on your smart phone, so you can read it anywhere you want.

Victor Parisi:

You can spend your free time to learn this book this e-book. This What if Gravity is not a force? is simple to
bring you can read it in the park, in the beach, train in addition to soon. If you did not have got much space to
bring often the printed book, you can buy the particular e-book. It is make you better to read it. You can save
the book in your smart phone. Thus there are a lot of benefits that you will get when you buy this book.
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